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Editorial Review

Review
Part I: THE NATURE OF CRIME, LAW, AND CRIMINAL JUSTICE. 1. Crime and Criminal Justice. 2.
The Nature of Crime and Victimization. 3. Criminal Law: Substance and Procedure. Part II: THE POLICE
AND LAW ENFORCEMENT. 4. Police in Society: History and Organization. 5. The Police: Role and
Function. 6. Issues in Policing: Professional, Social, and Legal. Part III: COURTS AND ADJUDICATION.
7. Courts, Prosecution, and the Defense. 8. Pretrial and Trial Procedures. 9. Punishment and Sentencing. Part
IV: CORRECTIONS AND ALTERNATIVE SANCTIONS. 10. Community Sentences: Probation,
Intermediate Sanctions, and Restorative Justice. 11. Corrections: History, Institutions, and Populations. 12.
Prison Life: Living in and Leaving Prison. Part V: CONTEMPORARY ISSUES IN AMERICAN
CRIMINAL JUSTICE. 13. Juvenile Justice in the Twenty First Century. 14. Criminal Justice in the New
Millennium.

About the Author
Larry J. Siegel was born in the Bronx in 1947. While living on Jerome Avenue and attending City College of
New York (CCNY) in the 1960s, he was swept up in the social and political currents of the time. He became
intrigued with the influence contemporary culture had on individual behavior: Did people shape society, or
did society shape people? He applied his interest in social forces and human behavior to the study of crime
and justice. After graduating from CCNY, he attended the newly opened program in criminal justice at the
State University of New York at Albany, earning both his M.A. and Ph.D. degrees there. After completing
his graduate work, Dr. Siegel began his teaching career at Northeastern University and has also held teaching
positions at the University of Nebraska at Omaha, Saint Anselm College in New Hampshire, and in the
School of Criminology and Justice Studies at the University of Massachusetts at Lowell (UML). Now a
Professor Emeritus, he continues to teach courses on criminology and criminal justice in UML'S online
master's degree program. Dr. Siegel has written extensively in the area of crime and justice, including books
on juvenile law, delinquency, criminology, corrections, criminal justice, and criminal procedure. He is a
court-certified expert on police conduct and has testified in numerous legal cases.

John L. Worrall is Professor of Criminology at the University of Texas at Dallas (UTD). A Seattle native, he
received a B.A., double majoring in psychology and law and justice, from Central Washington University in
1994. Both his M.A. (criminal justice) and Ph.D. (political science) were received from Washington State
University, where he graduated in 1999. From 1999-2006, he was a member of the criminal justice faculty at
California State University, San Bernardino. He joined UTD in Fall 2006, was promoted to full professor in
2008, and in 2010 was selected to direct the criminology program, a position he held until 2015. He now
directs UTD's executive M.S. program in Justice Administration and Leadership. Dr. Worrall has published
articles and book chapters on a variety of topics ranging from legal issues in policing to crime measurement,
having recently been ranked one of the most prolific sole and lead authors in the discipline. Courses he
regularly teaches (and has authored texts for) include introductory criminal justice, criminal procedure, and
crime control policy. Dr. Worrall is active in the Academy of Criminal Justice Sciences, the American
Society of Criminology, and a number of regional associations. He regularly works with local criminal
justice agencies on evaluation projects and continues to serve as editor of the journal Police Quarterly.

Users Review

From reader reviews:
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Byron Jorgensen:

The book Essentials of Criminal Justice give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You should
use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting tension
or having big problem with the subject. If you can make looking at a book Essentials of Criminal Justice to
get your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge
about several or all subjects. You can know everything if you like start and read a reserve Essentials of
Criminal Justice. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or some others. So ,
how do you think about this book?

Christopher Ray:

The book Essentials of Criminal Justice can give more knowledge and information about everything you
want. So just why must we leave a very important thing like a book Essentials of Criminal Justice? A
number of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim in which book can give many info for us. It
is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you
may give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Essentials of Criminal Justice has simple
shape but you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can search the enormous world by
available and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Gladys Myers:

Now a day people who Living in the era just where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each details they get. How individuals to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading
through a book can help people out of this uncertainty Information especially this Essentials of Criminal
Justice book because this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the information in this book
hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Suzanne Mitchell:

The book untitled Essentials of Criminal Justice contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains the
girl idea with easy way. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do definitely not worry, you
can easy to read this. The book was authored by famous author. The author brings you in the new period of
literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or device, so you
can read the book with anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open up their official
web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice go through.
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